
 Property Biz Canada

New downtown Ottawa BIA
leaders dealing with capital in
flux
Derek Abma | Property Biz Canada | 2013-10-23 | (0) Reply

Ottawa, and in particular its downtown core, is entering
a time of uncertain economic times, and a couple of the
business improvement areas at the centre of the action
have new leaders trying their best to work around the
turbulence.

Les Gagne has been executive director of the Sparks
Street Authority  for a little over a year. His group
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represents businesses along the pedestrian-only
portion of Sparks Street, one block south of the
parliamentary district.

He describes the environment facing businesses as
“challenging” due at least in part to about $1 billion
worth of renovations in progress or in the planning
stages, creating extended vacancies and repelling
many would-be customers from taking strolls through
the area.

“Obviously, construction is not a very good marketing
strategy for selling your place,” Gagne said. “It certainly
has created a lot of challenges to not only invite
(customers) but to encourage and to keep our
merchants doing well.”

Renovations to the Bank of Canada’s headquarters,
occupying the block surrounded by Sparks, Bank and
Wellington Streets, is the next big project Gagne is
anticipating.

The government effect

Then there’s the Bank Street BIA , representing
business operators and building owners occupying
most of Bank Street between the parliamentary district
and Highway 417. Christine Leadman, a former city
councillor who took over as  executive director in
September, says the ongoing reduction of the federal
public service hasn’t been the headache many might
assume.

“The employment base here is not just government,”
she said. “If you were to look at, say, Sparks Streets,
where most of the buildings are federal buildings . . .
ours is more mixed. There’s more private sector in the
area — accounting firms, lawyers, that sort of thing. ”

Still, she added: “It’s hard for me to gauge it because I
haven’t been here long enough to say, ‘Oh yeah, a year
ago it would’ve been much busier.’ ”

Leadman added that Bank Street businesses benefit
from a strong residential base, as new condominiums
bring in a more plentiful and younger demographic that
can sustain constant business activity.

Gagne, conversely, said businesses on Sparks Street
are feeling the effects of reduced foot traffic as a result
of the shrinking federal government. He’s also worried
about the implications of anticipated relocations of
government operations, such as when the Department
of National Defence moves into the old Nortel Networks
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Corp. campus in Ottawa’s west end.

“I’m a firm believer that the government needs to spend
more time, investment and commitment to making sure
that their core is dynamic, strong and prospering,” he
said. “I think we’ve had plenty of suburban sprawl to
the point where I think it’s hurt the downtown core.”

Sparks Street consists mainly of low-rise buildings with
many consumer-oriented businesses on the ground
floors and offices of the upper floors.

Gagne estimated that about 40 per cent of the space
within his jurisdiction is vacant. The federal government
owns all of the buildings on the north side of Sparks
Street and is not as quick as private-sector owners to
fill vacancies, Gagne said.

“People have said to me, ‘Les, if the government sold
all the buildings on the north side of Sparks Street,
you’d see a completely different attitude about the
downtown,’ ” he said. “Right now, a lot of that space is
empty, and where’s the incentive to fill it? The taxpayer
is paying for it whether it’s full or not.”

Leadman said there are just a handful of vacancies
among the hundreds of retail spaces in her area. One
real estate-related problem for her members is that
many feel their properties are being assessed at
inflated values, leading to higher property taxes.

“(For) property owners, the assessed values on their
properties sometimes aren’t really justified,” she said.
“In terms of the way the assessment works, if you have
new condos coming into an area and new retail at
grade, of course they’re raising the assessment in the
area even though your building may not have changed

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

Commercial

growth

RESEARCH REPORTS
World GBC: Health, Wellbeing and Productivity in
Offices

2014-09-30

Avison Young: Canada US Office Mid-Year Market
Report

2014-09-16

Commercial Property Finanacing Renaissance: JLL
Debt Capital Markets Canada

2014-07-10

BOMA BESt Energy and Environment Report: The
National Green Building Report

2014-06-26

INDUSTRY EVENTS
Vancouver Real Estate Leasing Conference

2014-10-29

Global Property Market Conference
2014-12-02

Toronto Real Estate Forum
2014-12-03 - 2014-12-04

1970-01-01

http://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/aclk?sa=L&ai=CxT2ewxtJVJ6PF4LJwQHWjYBoiKr9yQUAABABIJCPxhtQmrCKmAVg_aCZgegDyAECqQK1gW51-NqtPuACAKgDAcgDnQSqBKABT9AowvRCVRKtvb38k2Z1LPDFN4zcl6G95atrIMEPYJkOS86uqcNj7Ych9aUhq45KezKalC57CwDz6pU6Dm7gKTqWLt1BcIVVLx03Fkn9ohmMNVYKLeXXAD98PiFLU44aSkxH0WimjBtA-q1mg8RyvIpOQbkdFZsWtNgiY0kzSSrdIgnA4MDbz1Jg3aOssCAftKFQ-P9KweE88dlOFxPz4-AEAZAGAaAGFA&num=0&cid=5GgXIawhmqfla7YO-5fxvJd_&sig=AOD64_2tXfoGNQQsf_iwevFYr-8B6n9hsw&client=ca-pub-8791389362794036&adurl=http://www.timbercreek.com
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/concert-properties-now-too-big-too-busy-to-hide/
http://www.worldgbc.org/activities/health-wellbeing-productivity-offices/
http://www.avisonyoung.com/fileDownloader.php?file=files/content-files/Research/Links/2014/AYMid14CanadaUSOfficeMktReportAug13_14Final.pdf
http://renx.ca/wp-content/uploads/2014/07/14july10-JLL-CREFinanceRenaissance.pdf
http://www.bomabest.com/wp-content/uploads/BBEER-2014-Press-Release.pdf
http://www.realestateforums.com/vancouverrel/en/index.php
http://www.realestateforums.com/globalproperty/en/index.php
http://www.realestateforums.com/torontoref/en/


Subscribe
If you enjoyed this article,
subscribe to receive more

at all. . . . I haven’t seen assessments going down in
any of the areas.”

Eco-district? ‘Seeing is believing’

Both BIA leaders like the idea of turning downtown
Ottawa into an eco-district, as proposed by local
commercial real estate broker James McNeil  as a way
to attract multinational corporations who make
sustainability a key part of their branding.

Gagne, however, fears a situation in which there is
plenty of top-down enforcement of standards.

“When you start instituting these things, they
sometimes lose the organic feel of what they’re
intended to be,” he said. “I’d hate to see it become a
bureaucratic approach. I’d love more of an organic or
more of a ground-roots push.”

Leadman said there still is a lack of detail on just how
an eco-district would be implemented.

“What is it going to do?” she said. “What (is the city)
doing? What’s the long-term plan that the city has? . . .
As much as this is something I think would be a good
step, particularly in areas where the buildings are aged .
. . seeing is believing.”

 

Tags: featured
Read more from: Property Biz Canada

About the Author (Author Profile)

Other articles from
Hamilton Canmet lab wins award in brownfields
development
Developers encouraged to build along Ottawa light
rail line
Ottawa developer awaits sales before proceeding
with commercial condos
Ottawa office market professionals maintain
confidence
Double-digit office vacancy predicted for Ottawa

http://jjmcneil.ca/
http://renx.ca/tag/featured/
http://renx.ca/category/property-biz/
http://renx.ca/?author=50
http://renx.ca/hamilton-canmet-lab-wins-award-in-brownfields-development/
http://renx.ca/developers-encouraged-to-build-along-ottawa-light-rail-line/
http://renx.ca/ottawa-developer-awaits-sales-before-proceeding-with-commercial-condo/
http://renx.ca/ottawa-office-market-professionals-maintain-confidence/
http://renx.ca/double-digit-office-vacancy-predicted-for-ottawa/



