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Office condo brings unique
ownership opportunity to
downtown Ottawa
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Windmill Development Group  has launched a unique
opportunity for businesses to invest in real estate
through ownership of luxury downtown Ottawa office
condominiums.

Windmill’s development site is on the west side of
downtown Ottawa next to Christ Church Cathedral
Ottawa, appropriately called Cathedral Hill. The
developer has a 21-storey residential condominium
under construction and nearing completion on this
land.  However, more than one new building can fit on
the property.

Home Property Biz Canada Commercial Residential Green RENX Events

Readers Write Sign UpSign UpLog inLog in

NEWS SUBSCRIPTION
Property Biz Commercial

Residential Green Ottawa Events

First Name  Last Name

Email Address  submit

Privacy guaranteed. We never share your info.

RECENT NEWSLETTERS

SEARCH What Are You Looking For?

Recent Newsletters RENX News

http://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/aclk?sa=L&ai=CalsdwRpJVLOZD9GYpgPJsIG4BNDZlPAEAAAQASCQj8YbUKCyvqsCYP2gmYHoA8gBAqkCtYFudfjarT7gAgCoAwHIA50EqgS8AU_QC13fv41vpQ7fRjo-JR-acdqgbP86v9Ha0atLCx8pElUSxkuyJ0UKN_2xk-QN-d-Mww0cIzZ0VAdlXAh1nkWb6GYLqUmrNZP8wOMlKadmHzxZ8sse6_IUUUTajnHfQ1qbyen67WNzCKkygv00TthE-HVudnHUGt0eWmI_frLMdi9U0a5h4VW8jEsQjfE7ZNyjNX1YU79C0fNt9tIjzZ__bgsxpFvydEW-BlEGReLcLh7kJj5W2HSfOt0u4AQBkAYBoAYU&num=0&cid=5GgyGKwwhdoMU2qUa7I3rHLx&sig=AOD64_2f5xF7X1kl_FfnWQjwjd5V5O0sPQ&client=ca-pub-8791389362794036&adurl=http://www.timbercreekfunds.com
http://renx.ca/
http://triovest.com/
http://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/aclk?sa=L&ai=CXKRswRpJVLWZD9GYpgPJsIG4BPiAy4AFAAAQASCQj8YbUICft_v7_____wFg_aCZgegDyAECqQK1gW51-NqtPuACAKgDAcgDnQSqBLwBT9CEBIBahlTEQRHfuNN4cZ4Osi4yIt_mlOT8rxYn3-xftUuiL-rrpr5lrLBy6Na7C9Ro5vtHq7JO3LYAYK808r5HllC0N6frOwktklN34ZkGruET8hBvF2KsuYMYAEihSf1dw9wfa23-2yJ7-3r939GM96ud9Sx0QfnHKVlyFrnPb12C_RCdHecTvm71sBcCfEFrJJbZlRdGry_zjT-oE4B8HmnERsuhlQj0y1ThBgJ921HtA3r3gxRXuYXgBAGQBgGgBhQ&num=0&cid=5GiLAZZ8lob_vzqlvr7dw1E6&sig=AOD64_01dCEwJnkN78MpSQxHJq9x0gy0Tg&client=ca-pub-8791389362794036&adurl=http://www.atriummic.com/
http://renx.ca/category/property-biz/
http://renx.ca/windmill-development-group-brings-unique-ownership-opportunity-to-the-downtown-core/
http://renx.ca/author/hkirk/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/property-biz/
http://renx.ca/windmill-development-group-brings-unique-ownership-opportunity-to-the-downtown-core/#comments
http://www.windmilldevelopments.com/
http://www.cathedralhill.ca/
http://renx.ca/
http://renx.ca/category/property-biz/
http://renx.ca/category/commercial/
http://renx.ca/category/residential/
http://renx.ca/category/green/
http://renx.ca/renx-events/
http://renx.ca/readers-write/
http://renx.ca/wp-login.php?action=register
http://renx.ca/wp-login.php
http://www.linkedin.com/company/real-estate-news-exchange-renx-
http://www.twitter.com/RENXca
http://www.facebook.com/pages/RENX/192049517513471
http://renx.ca/feed/
mailto:thankyou@renx.ca
http://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/aclk?sa=L&ai=CSHoUwRpJVNWZD9GYpgPJsIG4BKDrmvAEAAAQASCQj8YbUMCFuLgCYP2gmYHoA8gBAqkCtYFudfjarT7gAgCoAwHIA50EqgTBAU_QUyyVbwzZNzlhX_H5XT-KgFrRB8tyBihTgTuLlMHPirTRt3dms2qZTU-5-Vs0g91Nk3RgWdTpNkfOiQqub2eOjEaYxNNS3jA8BsnFCvDmJj7QmiXlXT4YAOducWXWfJteUI2dwLIiniscAjbAVdoJ0gczQVBDBaKxVSmcgCgTFJjQP61yPsG0RNyCkzcrZef-R82abK7k-ZkZ7tMBSgjeeJC8eXVOjodllGx6YPUhcMeO5aCDb2-6sSysp8BHhm_gBAGQBgGgBhQ&num=0&cid=5GiYvnYfMnJAn5IrqQuvVpQz&sig=AOD64_0q5aEjW-YPIkzB-XfVI3Dx9FlohA&client=ca-pub-8791389362794036&adurl=http://www.realpac.ca/
http://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/aclk?sa=L&ai=Cp-5nwRpJVNeZD9GYpgPJsIG4BPC0n_wFAAAQASCQj8YbUMSi97sBYP2gmYHoA8gBAqkCtYFudfjarT7gAgCoAwHIA50EqgTCAU_QKWBKlvHIMRVSwKzOz8ToQlSY-xr3RFz4Evv9rMEEFVN7pU08_7IBsDOIM2EuEjtyU2K1_FNHdxqKWLY-pLsj6e1ijPkVBJTNb2XZoc6Ob7e5guj4XDQ7QgpGug5ANqjJxct3SXwmdZ5JRQg5DqesQ7JsPuyaqTDBGd9rOh7gMKVc5HpvD5Fg_Nef22jppftR1m0NSCY0DcstCvjRfVrbECWo4v9RJ5HuaVYxloNrq6WjFe2ehyEyBkb5gKGSU_rB4AQBkAYBoAYU&num=0&cid=5Gj9ig0kUhQJP8lBXD54S-tB&sig=AOD64_3TTQB7LZHPweaiummvfGiF3S5qxQ&client=ca-pub-8791389362794036&adurl=http://www.realpropertysolutions.ca/
http://googleads.g.doubleclick.net/aclk?sa=L&ai=CxRhMwRpJVLaZD9GYpgPJsIG4BKi79vsFAAAQASCQj8YbUKPm4-f-_____wFg_aCZgegDyAECqQK1gW51-NqtPuACAKgDAcgDnQSqBLwBT9A1qhom02OGR22BvjjVgJSgUyT0RTs04sXwZmprhefLh0ma7DjE7llcNkGH4BZT3kIibg-coC7XgC4ssuSYXkgcAH6q8Z4h4BPNa1m64kUF-dlTl8tuy958A2koJj1U7QN6UHslIakrVi8jvZBxQst0bfA1k-PEUS8czvAP1NSiIXeVyVwjdHXtf9qDNg5teXiPr9531k5gHML7OiqIepjKCsyviu98L-EVYzmp8O6-zjg4ObmIyrhG9srgBAGQBgGgBhQ&num=0&cid=5Gg7vy3gv7EOFxkvXEesZYX1&sig=AOD64_3YKdBGfV310Ru9FnJfngmoQ0qFNw&client=ca-pub-8791389362794036&adurl=http://www.1021westhastings.com/
http://renx.ca/newsletter
http://renx.ca/renx-news-archive


“We’ve had
this property
for a while
and
considered
different
options,” said
Windmill
partner
Rodney Wilts.
“The timing is
right and the
way forward
is clear.”

That way
forward is construction of a 12-storey commercial
condominium complex, Cathedral Hill Executive
Offices.  It will be located east of the church (the
residential condominium is on the west side of the
church) and feature “everything you would expect from
a class-A property” including stunning views, bike
parking, a beautiful lobby and a sixth-floor shared
board room and meeting space. 

“Mid- to high-rise downtown office condos are popular
in other cities including Toronto, Montreal, New York
and Chicago, but the concept is relatively unique to
Ottawa where until now, suburban office condos held
more of a draw,” said JJMcNeil Commercial Inc. ‘s 
James McNeil, the exclusive marketing agent for the
property.

“Look at what was done with the Garland Building  in
Chicago,” he said.  The 21-storey landmark property,
constructed in 1922 has been renovated, restored and
converted into modern office condos.

Springcress nearly sold out

Closer to home and confirming the popularity of more
suburban office condos, he cites the success of
Ottawa’s Springcress located at 2200 Prince of Wales
Drive, a project which McNeil says is almost sold out.

“From an investment stand, investing in urban centres
is very desirable – think location, location. The
opportunity to acquire real estate on the future LRT
(light rail transit), with easy access to the interprovincial
bridge (Portage), the John A McDonald parkway, routes
to the airport and Queensway and the entire Ottawa
bike path system at your doorstep is amazing.”
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ADVERTISEMENT

Wilts said this project, located at the western edge of
downtown, is part of the overall core transformation.

“The downtown has spread west of the Parliamentary
precinct,” Wilts said. “Where it used to be federal
government-focused and made up of large tenancies,
now we’re moving towards smaller tenancies and
sustainability.

“There is also the opportunity to tie into other
opportunities including Ottawa’s EcoDistrict initiatives.”

The total property will feature 125,000 square feet and
individual spaces will be fully variable ranging from 450
sq. ft. to entire floors. McNeil says the late-May soft
launch has already attracted interest in 50,000 sq. ft. of
the available real estate.

He says initial research suggested the project would be
of interest to small business owners but larger players
have also come to the table, including foreign
governments with an interest in locating embassy
offices near the Parliamentary Precinct. Other interest
has come from investors.

“Attraction of putting money into an investment”

“The low cost of money now means monthly carrying
charges can make buying less than paying rent. As with
home ownership, the attraction of putting money into
an investment rather than a rental space has value,”
McNeil said.

Wilts says for business owners, the opportunity to build
future equity can be invaluable. “Especially for small
business owners, the chance to invest in something
that could one day represent a pension is important.”
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He says traditionally owning space in downtown Ottawa
meant buying an older property and converting it, with
all of the inherent surprises and costs involved.

McNeil says it is also important to consider that vacant
leasable space in the core is often in B- and C-class
buildings with deferred maintenance concerns, so
access to a class-A property and the added investment
opportunity is a double bonus.

“Certainly there is upfront equity required, so this may
be for established businesses rather than start-ups, but
as the demand for green property and healthier
environments grows, the investment in a top LEED
property and the equity that investment has built will
mean even more.”

He says 27 per cent of office buildings in Ottawa have
an environmental certification and the Cathedral Hill
property has the potential to be the most sustainable
building in the city.

“Windmill is always looking to using the best
technologies and materials that are not only healthier
but will last longer. The features and design together
with these create a high overall sustainability goal.”

Focused on high sustainability

Windmill is focused on high sustainability and
performance goals on all of its projects.
“Conventionally, we target LEED Platinum but there is
an opportunity to go beyond,” Wilts said.

Going beyond may mean becoming a One Planet
Community , tagged as the earth’s greenest
communities, which he says is also an option with
Windmill’s development of the former Domtar Lands
along the Ottawa River.

There will be assistance available to buyers for design,
creativity and the construction of the individual
properties, which McNeil expects could range from
modern and fully open floor plans to private office
spaces of rich wood and marble.

Once occupied a property management team will be
responsible for the shell and all common elements and
owners will be responsible for their own interior spaces.
“Condo bylaws will ensure exterior appearances
including things like doors and window coverings but
inside their four walls, owners will do what they like,”
Wilts said.

http://www.oneplanetcommunities.org/
http://www.windmilldevelopments.com/project-portfolio/les-isles/


A condominium board, similar to that of a residential
condo, will make decisions about the property with
voting based on members’ pro-rated share of the
overall building.

Wilts says depending on interest construction may
begin by the fall of 2014 or spring of 2015 with the goal
of Q4 2016 occupancy.

Initial information about the project is available at
whylease.ca .

The specs on Cathedral Hill 

Rising 21 storeys, Cathedral Hill offers an exceptionally
unique and balanced urban lifestyle. Situated on the
western edge of downtown, close to Ottawa’s most
distinguished landmarks and desirable amenities, the
tower encompasses 140 luxuriously appointed
condominiums offering:

Unparalleled and protected views of the Ottawa River,
Gatineau Park, Parliament Hill and Sparks Street;
Striking and sophisticated, modern architecture that
respects the heritage of the site;
Contemporary interior design with exceptional attention to
detail;
A respectful approach to the environment with sustainable
development, targeting LEED Gold minimum;
Full lifestyle amenities including executive concierge;
The vibrancy and convenience of downtown living within
serene, natural green surroundings.

Building on Windmill Developments’ impressive track
record, this project promises to be one of the most
healthy, environmentally friendly and sought-after
condominiums in Canada. 
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